
TYT 30.10.2023 D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N

1 HAZAL B. SAY 21 1 20,8 1 -0,25 3 2 2,5 20 2 19,5 4 1 3,75 6 6 5 5 3 2 2,5 1 1 60,75

2 ENES KN SAY 14 10 11,5 3 1 2,75 4 1 3,75 12 7 10,3 2 2 3 2 2,5 1 2 0,5 2 1 1,75 2 1 1,75 36,75

3 ENES KÇ SAY 23 14 19,5 2 3 1,25 2 3 1,25 3 2 2,5 1 3 0,25 3 2 2,5 6 -1,5 3 2 2,5 3 2 2,5 30,75

4 EREN ÇAĞRI A. SAY 23 12 20 2 3 1,25 3 3 4 2 3,5 1 2 0,5 3 1 2,75 1 2 0,5 2 2 33,5

5 ZEYNEP A. SAY 32 4 31 1 3 0,25 3 1 2,75 12 7 10,3 2 2 1,5 3 2 2,5 3 2 2,5 3 2 2,5 53,25

6 ZEYNEP V. SAY 18 12 15 2 -0,5 3 1 2,75 12 7 10,3 1 2 0,5 3 -0,75 1 3 0,25 1 1 28,5

7 SİNEM Ş. SAY 25 9 22,8 2 2 1,5 1 3 0,25 3 7 1,25 2 1 1,75 1 3 0,25 1 4 2 2 1,5 3 3 32,25

8 SUDENUR I. SAY 25 9 22,8 2 1 1,75 2 2 1,5 8 4 7 1 1 0,75 3 1 2,75 2 -0,5 3 3 4 1 3,75 42,75

9 SALİHA İREM K. SAY 24 13 20,8 3 1 2,75 3 3 5 3 4,25 1 1 0,75 2 2 2 1 1,75 3 3 4 1 3,75 42

10 TUANA D. SAY 27 9 24,8 3 2 2,5 3 2 2,5 3 5 1,75 2 1 1,75 2 2 1,5 1 1 3 2 2,5 4 4 42,25

11 NİSA Y. SAY 19 10 16,5 4 -1 1 3 0,25 2 2 1,5 1 2 0,5 1 1 0,75 1 -0,25 1 1 0,75 3 2 2,5 21,5

12 KÜBRANUR Y. SAY 30 8 28 1 4 3 2 2,5 3 5 1,75 1 1 3 2 2,5 1 4 3 1 2,75 38,5

13 DİLARA İ. SAY 28 6 26,5 2 2 1,5 2 2 2 5 0,75 3 1 2,75 5 1 4,75 1 2 0,5 1 3 0,25 2 3 1,25 40,25

14 ZEYNEP SUDE İ. EA 28 9 25,8 2 2 1,5 3 2 2,5 12 10 9,5 1 -0,25 4 1 3,75 4 1 3,75 46,5

15 HATİCE DOGA K. EA 27 8 25 1 2 0,5 4 1 3,75 9 9 6,75 1 1 0,75 1 1 0,75 2 3 1,25 3 2 2,5 41,25

16 ELİF NAZ B. EA 30 5 28,8 4 1 3,75 4 4 11 2 10,5 5 5 1 1 2 2 5 5 5 5 65

17 GÜLFİDAN Ç. EA 21 14 17,5 1 4 2 3 1,25 2 -0,5 2 2 1 1 0,75 3 3 3 2 2,5 26,5

18 ARDA A. EA 23 13 19,8 2 2 1,5 2 2 1,5 2 -0,5 2 3 1,25 1 1 0,75 1 -0,25 1 1 0,75 2 3 1,25 26

19 İREM NAZ K. EA 26 6 24,5 2 2 1,5 3 2 2,5 3 3 2,25 2 1 1,75 1 1 1 1 0,75 4 4 5 5 43,25

20 AYNUR K. EA 20 13 16,8 3 2 2,5 2 3 1,25 3 3 2,25 1 -0,25 1 -0,25 2 -0,5 3 3 4 1 3,75 28,5

21 CEYDA Ş. EA 25 9 22,8 1 3 0,25 4 1 3,75 4 2 3,5 2 2 1,5 1 1 1 2 0,5 4 4 2 2 1,5 38,75

22 MUKADDES K. EA 27 9 24,8 3 -0,75 2 2 1,5 6 5 4,75 1 -0,25 1 1 0,75 1 1 0,75 3 1 2,75 4 1 3,75 38

23 SERAP Ö. EA 24 9 21,8 5 -1,25 1 3 0,25 2 6 0,5 1 4 1 3 0,25 2 1 1,75 1 3 0,25 3 2 2,5 26

24 AYŞE P. EA 26 8 24 3 1 2,75 3 1 2,75 5 4 4 1 1 2 2 1 -0,25 2 3 1,25 2 3 1,25 38,75

25 RABİANUR E. EA 27 5 25,8 1 3 0,25 1 2 0,5 4 4 3 1 1 3 3 1 -0,25 3 1 2,75 3 2 2,5 38,5

26 MELİKE A. EA 26 12 23 3 2 2,5 5 5 12 7 10,3 1 2 0,5 2 1 1,75 2 2 4 4 5 5 54

27  GÜLSEREN G. EA 16 23 10,3 5 -1,25 3 2 2,5 2 -0,5 2 1 1,75 1 3 0,25 4 -1 3 2 2,5 3 2 2,5 17
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